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You may go to the range every weekend, but are you using the best gear for your shooting style 
and training needs? It might be time to look into upgrading your range gear to make your range 
days even better. From quality-of-life upgrades like better mags for your 9mm ammo to higher-
quality accessories, you can find all the range gear upgrades you need at Cheaper Than Dirt! 
 

 
 
Upgrade Your Mags 
 
It might not seem like a huge upgrade, but better-quality magazines can vastly improve your 
shooting experience. Cheaper Than Dirt makes it easy to find the best mags for your guns with a 
make and model finder. If you are rocking solid plastic mags for your AR-15, consider upgrading 
to a mag with a window or a semi-transparent mag so you can see how much 5.56 ammo is left 
in the mag. You can also switch from metal to polymer mags or vice versa. 
 
Invest in Digital Ear Protection 
 
Are you still using the classic orange earplugs? They do the job just fine but make it hard to hold 
a conversation at the range. With digital ear protection, you get earmuffs that let you hear 
normal conversation while still protecting your ears from loud gunfire. As soon as it detects the 
crack of a shot, it cuts off the microphone, protecting your ears from damage. You can also get 
smaller digital earbuds that achieve nearly the same effect without the bulk of earmuffs. 
 
You Deserve a Better Range Bag 
 
You’re doing yourself a disservice if you’re using an old duffel bag as your range bag. Range-
specific bags offer tons of compartments meant for accessories and will hold all of your mags, 

https://www.cheaperthandirt.com/ammunition/?fq=CALIBER:9mm+Luger+or+9x19mm
https://www.cheaperthandirt.com/ammunition/rifle-ammo/223-remington-and-556-nato/
https://www.cheaperthandirt.com/


firearms, accessories, and 7.62 ammo perfectly. Many feature MOLLE webbing, letting you 
customize them further. You might not think you need one, but once you try a purpose-built 
range bag, you’ll never go back. 
 
Try New Targets 
 
Cheaper Than Dirt offers a wide variety of targets, including paper and reactive targets. From 
targets that help you zero a new gun or train for competition to steel targets that make a 
satisfying ding when your aim is true, you can find what you need at great prices from Cheaper 
Than Dirt. 
 
Discover the Convenience of Automatic Clay Throwers 
 
You hand your friend a handheld clay thrower, yell, “Pull!” and watch as the clay takes a 
disappointing arc before hitting the ground. It’s a waste of a clay pigeon and not fun for 
anyone. You’re only as good as the person throwing the clay, and we’d all like a little more 
consistency. With an automatic clay thrower, you can get a perfect throw every time. Plus, you 
can shoot clays solo, as you can operate the thrower with a convenient foot pedal. 
 
Find range tools and accessories to improve your range days  
at https://www.cheaperthandirt.com/ 
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