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Spring break is a break from the ordinary. For some, it’s a celebration of the end of winter. For 
others, spring break is a respite from school or work. It’s a week or two to clear your mind, 
meditate, and become immersed in something new and maybe even unexpected. 
 

 
 
With Cuvée, you can expect an experience unlike any other. They bring your perfect spring 
break escape to life. Start your Cuvée experience by browsing their collection of luxury 
vacation house rentals. Where your getaway goes from there is entirely up to you. Cuvée’s 
expert team of Experience Curators can work closely with you to handcraft a spring break that 
defies all expectations. 
 
Redefining Spring Break 
 
Everyone has their vision for spring break. You may have your mind set on a relaxing getaway 
on a sunny beach somewhere, a thousand miles away from your everyday routine. You might 
picture yourself sipping on an expertly crafted cocktail while reading a good book overlooking 
Mexico’s sapphire waters. Or you might want to dive into those waters and swim with sea 
turtles. 
 
Cuvée can turn your wildest dreams into a reality. Whether you plan on enjoying spring break 
with family, your friend group, your significant other, or anyone else, you can find luxury 
vacation homes you’ll love to call your home away from home. From Hawaii in the Pacific to St. 
Barts in the Atlantic, Cuvée is ready to help you define spring break your way. 
 
Bespoke Adventures Around Every Corner 
 
Cuvée offers so much more than incredible luxury house rentals. While they definitely have 
you covered with a luxurious home for your stay, Cuvée can also craft bespoke adventures and 
captivating experiences in your location of choice, from the beaches of Mexico to the Tuscan 
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countryside. These are the kinds of experiences that you and your party will remember for 
years to come. 
 
If you love coffee, you’ll undoubtedly want to trek to Kona on the Big Island of Hawaii. Your 
Hawaiian Experience Curator can help make it happen. They can set up a visit where you see 
the source of the famed Kona coffee—not to mention a tasting! It’s an experience that engages 
all your senses. 
 
On the other side of the globe, perhaps you want to relish the French-inspired fine dining on St. 
Barts. This island getaway is known for its captivating cuisine. As an intersection of global 
cultures, it’s cuisine you’re unlikely to find anywhere else, and that makes it an experience you 
won’t want to miss. 
 
Luxurious Amenities Abound 
 
When you’re eager to escape the ordinary for a rejuvenating spring break, the amenities 
matter. Let’s say, for a moment, you have your heart set on a Hawaiian spring break. Thanks to 
Cuvée, you and your guests arrive at the Kahua Kohola Estate. This Cuvée curated property is 
found on the Big Island and features five bedroom suites. 
 
The Kahua Kohola Estate includes everything from a chef-style kitchen to outdoor shower 
gardens. Plunge into the infinity pool, sit around the fire pit, and enjoy the grand views of the 
Pacific. It may just be the perfect place to clear the mind and recenter yourself.  
 
Discover an immersive spring break escape at https://www.cuvee.com/  
 
Original Source: https://bit.ly/435B1Ax 
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